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For our geography learning, go for a 
walk in your local area.  Can you 
name the different buildings? Can 
you talk about what they are called 
and used for? Draw pictures of what 
they look like and label them. For 
example, a house, flat, pharmacy, 
post office, hairdresser.

Following our PE lessons, can you 
jump 10 times, 15 or 20 times? How 
did you feel at the beginning and at 
the end of the activity? Draw a 
picture, label or write a sentence 
about how you feel. Starting with ‘I 
felt …..’

We are learning about the human 
body in science, can you practise 
singing the song heads, shoulders, 
knees and toes.
Heads, shoulders, knees and toes 
(youtube.com)

Head, Shoulders, Knees & Toes - 
Exercise Song For Kids with DJ Raphi 
(youtube.com)

For our maths learning, collect 
objects at home and sort them into 
different groups. Can you draw and 
name the groups of objects? 

For science, we are learning about 
our five senses, visit a favourite place 
of yours and draw, label and/or write 
sentences about the place. What can 
you hear and see? What does it 
smell or feel like? 

In PSHE, we are learning how to 
regulate our feelings. With a grown 
up, can you talk about what makes 
you feel happy, draw a picture, label 
or write a sentence about feeling 
happy e.g I feel happy when I ….

Linked to geography and DT, can you 
make a building using junk modelling 
materials i.e. boxes, cardboard tubes, 
recycling materials.

Share, read and talk about a book 
with an adult. Can you name the 
characters in the book? Can you draw 
a picture and write the name(s) of 
the characters.

Choose your homework from the menu below and record in the  homework book: Complete one a 
week in your child’s homework book and hand in on Mondays with your reading folders.
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